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IOWA UTILITIES BOARD 
Customer Service Section 

 
 Docket No.: FCU-2016-0009  
 Utility: Dakota Access, LLC 
 File Date: May 4, 2016 
 Memo Date: May 4, 2016 
 
TO: The EFS 
 
FROM: Jane Whetstone, Customer Service Coordinator 
 
SUBJECT: George Patrick Benner Complaint 
 
The following emails relating to a complaint from George Patrick Benner filed on 
behalf by Stephen Benner.   Additional information was required before the 
complaint was complete for upload to EFS.  
 
From: Tormey, Donald [IUB]  
Sent: Wednesday, April 27, 2016 3:42 PM 
To: Whetstone, Jane [IUB] 
Subject: FW: Call from pipeline landowner 
 
Jane – see my email to Cecil and David below and we will set this up as an FCU 
once Mr. Benner sends his email, which I expect tomorrow.  
 
I had a call from a Mr. Stephen Benner, who stated he has power of attorney for 
his brother (George P. Benner) and he stated that Dakota Access may have 
illegally cut down large trees on his brother’s parcel sometime around March 12 
or 13 and wants to be compensated if they illegally cut those trees down.  He 
stated the parcel is in Lee County around 270th Avenue, which may be section 
22?  
 
Thanks!   
 
Don Tormey 
Manager, Customer Service & Communications 
1375 E. Court Avenue 
Des Moines, Iowa  50319-0069 
Don.tormey@iub.iowa.gov  
Phone: 515.725.7347 
Website: https://iub.iowa.gov 
 
  

State of Iowa  Department of Commerce  Utilities Division 

mailto:Don.tormey@iub.iowa.gov
https://iub.iowa.gov/
Shelleyl
Filed - Date Only

Shelleyl
Manual Entry - Black



Docket No.: FCU-2016-0009 
May 4, 2016 
Page 2 

From: Dolores Benner [mailto:dbenner@hughes.net]  
Sent: Monday, May 02, 2016 11:43 AM 
To: Tormey, Donald [IUB] 
Subject: tree cutting 
 
Sir,  as to the issue of what I believe was improper timber cutting that was done 
on March 16th on the parcel number Ia-Le-176.000, I wish to file a formal protest 
as the land owner was not informed that the trees were to be cut. They (trees) 
were to be logged, as to why it had not been done as I was spending 5 weeks in 
Rochester Mn. at the Mayo clinic for cancer treatment. I returned on March 18 at 
the end of treatment to find that the trees had been cut in a manner that made it 
impossible to save. Dakota Access put a value of $9,000 dollars in the 
settlement. When I asked for compensation it was laughed at. 
  
Respectfully 
  
Stephen Benner 
 
-------- Original message -------- 
From: "Whetstone, Jane [IUB]" <Jane.Whetstone@iub.iowa.gov>  
Date: 5/2/16 3:00 PM (GMT-06:00)  
To: dbenner@hughes.net  
Subject: FW: tree cutting  

Dear Mr. Benner, 

 Your email was received by the Iowa Utilities Board (Board) regarding the issue 
with the timber cutting on March 16, 2016.  In order to process your complaint, I 
would need the address for the location of the parcel mentioned in the 
complaint.  My understanding is this is the land owned by your brother. 

Can you also please provide a contact telephone number for you? 

Thanks 

Jane Whetstone 

From: dbenner [mailto:dbenner@hughes.net]  
Sent: Tuesday, May 03, 2016 8:22 PM 
To: Whetstone, Jane [IUB] 
Subject: RE: FW: tree cutting 
 
Janet Whetstone , my telephone number is 319-540-5563. My brother is George 
Patrick Benner, his address is G Patrick Benner 3250 270 Ave Keokuk Iowa 
52632. Dakota Access has on file the power of attorney given to me by my 
brother to act on his behalf in this matter.            Stephen Benner 
 
Sent from my U.S. Cellular® Smartphone 
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